ISR Ho Eho Telo-33004/99 _REGD.NO.D.T.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

EXTRAORDINARY
M [I—W@UE 3 —39-|UEL (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section ()
iR | T
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY
. 402) 7 faeett, Wivam, armer 12, 2013/5m@W 21, 1935
No. 402] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, AUGUST 12, 2013/SHRAVANA 21, 1935

AT 3T I e
( arforeg fowmn)
AT
& fawett, 12 9, 2013
WAL, 540( 31)—P=a waR, foetw anfi = sffmm, 2005 (2005 =T 28) ! 41 55 §RT

W IfeRTE 1 WA 1 g Fawty snfée s frem, 2006 @57 3t gviv $1 F o Aefatey
fram st 2, st -

1. () = Pt o1 S A anfdie e () Frm 2013 2 |

{2) A ST § S FHTIE H ARG B ovga 2 |

2. ﬁﬂﬂaﬁtﬁmﬁﬂﬁuﬁzooe(ﬁﬁsﬂﬁmwwﬁmww@%ﬁszﬁ
Sufrm (1) & @vs (X) ¥ Frafafed wge s wnfia fear o, s

wg fafrT g, R o g S W W e 90 Wil g ok A, Red
WHF AT FTH AP & Sl iR Jarelt 1 qfiRed wgern wRE & ve ved Jaes S |
oy e 5 Wt argeht danelt Wi Tom-gw & T s W sw-ar e A
mwmw%mﬁwmﬁmwmmawmaﬁ
. BN JATTAIGT M A1 9 Ypfa @t Yard e Saey e |
3. 1o fam & s &, Sufram (2) § -

(i) G us (&%) #, -

@) P TR IRE TE P e ) U W R v W,

(M e Wge A N IR v @ i WU | SR e W/ o,
(ii) gvs (@) & I R freafaien ave w oeh serfq -

3488 Gl/2013 (1)



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY

[PaRT TI--SEc. 3(i)]

(@) () el fomfdse Soer o1 U@ 41 aifde Jawit & Rig semr el o= siera Rusogs
# 9y anfdfe 99 &1 varw tRER 1 oW e @1 e Wiy & g

R S WY TE geear gy & foag

(@ oy enfde W= A @
@ o Ry anfie &9 % Siver oimar &
% AfoRed A sgae fFar o -

W] ¥ R B Agar 6N R a7 @ fau a1 1o @1 sl Jaet & g /e
faew o WM # frdlt sfaRen daek @ forg oM iR 4 v=ite 2R arft o R
fifeenw, Srg-edR, mhar o fxdt ww Iw o & wnfie by o @1 wwmg 2

(i) g ANt @ gE dedfied sl @ @ Rw A anfde o @ v @ e
Pré [TaH & SR T A, g wedt o vt @ suR W e Fiffa seivew d @) e
any Bl S PR gr-

Laleaui)
qEY IV &3 SIqaR wed | ~Yod st Ffia &
Ealcu
il 1,00,000 @ .
GRS 50,000 T HI.
gt 25,000 T #H1,

g W A g snfdie om @ fon RNy smg w1 9 Sdwife winR sl Sireiw
SH 1 TN A S S wroft F e wed @ wad @ R W Ee s ar e
srenfiet emenia el &g RRR R onfdie &= @ e e am gEew  Bifife eives a9 @
amen grft |

Ty I AR 6 afe R anfdis S o w1 W sl & o g wnfdg ey o
TG § @ aF 9 20N O SN aifde gnm

g F® N R AR AR e SN @1 s W @ Ja-senfied, R e st
forerey arehfa, Wik ouil Suwex a1 1 ot & sterar w7 U T A, BT sneRa @ e @
fore vt feu o o7 seaTa ¥ o & T ReER A wwd A 8 ok s Frafiad e
FfT &= 39 o Aem-

(i) 3 W ¥ ST Hrenfiat sk A remReTe el d Red sttt oot Swew O o ot
IR B el e Wi &3 & g ey anfie <= i ey o @ s @
A R 7 Hiex BT fobq S R-UwRReTa Sl Seured e R @ fav 9 anfdie o
wfeferd T8 g |

(i) =7 ud smpue &= @ fow o= w1 @ wnfig vy o & g oRafag Rl s anfdies
S © AW A U9 BSIR O AL §



[ 9T [1—9E 3(i)] A 1 TS : STHTENT

IremTEe yew, finE, AftgR, Brqw, fearaa s, Swvds, fafdew, o el Mt @ feed
Iogers # XU fBy SiM @ wRara B 1 vEe, SR ol AR g A T o Al fEy anfdiew
SF & g aF geliv fRIR W Saw AoHfdw B |

e g% W fe Suew 4 # SuefEd aifeRe B argER weRt # Sude 9w onfdw e
(g denfiest ar gE et wnta da ARy sl dm @ seman @ W@y § wmaw fafife
&y TR faffdse &9 @1 509 & SR Sudy 4 § gor SRR @ 2 aoft & wed § amfRw
S WAl @ Wey W gan A e e s &9 @ v wfiea @

Wwﬁ%ww@%g%wmammﬁmwmﬁ
srfaRe Jaed BT oz & o wd &

WY 5 N 5 U & @ R ¥ w9 O wfowa & Rew geeww 89 @ fog e
foman g -
(i) @vs (M ¥’ e TR TS @ wE W ot W@ s @ e |

4. ao Fam @ w11 @ Sufem (1) 4 Bf wge & e fefatee wee
sia-wnfia fepa Srem  arerta-

g I% 4l & femm ey anfde oM o afe fad O 9fy o wwdem o sade @, o
o e nfAfafy 9 7a @ & O W R anffe 99 vger ¥ faemm W & gdy § e
TPR T Pob @ WIS B UH & 8N AfF W ¥ anfde A A wEmaem @ dadw & gweg
AireT @ U Bl o fee Ry e W A Rl 78 stawRa w oo @ € ek R
sadeEn § foy o ® witgpa s ff Ry anffe oW aftfram qen frsi @ a9 gen
SuEfda wrEl & fag o 9

5. 7o Fram @ W 19 @ U (2) F TR R 4 'wg T A B ad @ e w
Ry A F FoH 74 & Sudel & e W W@ S |

6. 1@ fram @ w74 & geaw, FeafaRes frem siawenfa fear o, arefq-
" 747 Oy e W soIgdl gR Ue ofttw § aM W anf&E @ siawm @Y% sord, e
arfdw 9 B sergdl o R Gt s vt anfErEt 9or ISl o Reeh o &fae @ e
T faiga w91 & e {9 anfée S @ arer 8N @1 ey i wadt & |

(i) TOE & U RO B dE@ P BA A B TE a9 B @ & Ay v g e g
T g @7 e W

(i) ST 3faRUl & AT B TUET YE B9 & AT <AqW o 991 A 3y @ frg fRearshe
@ 8

(ii) ¥ FBR BT BT rerm Sl Ht PRQAME AT WRR & gART @ s el

(iv) ofafil, sorg @ ar a6 Wi aevel B qUl ST @ e

(v) w74 @ seflv g sRefoa ar yoo vd afica, af &1 & 91 sioRureal 3o, @
At s afy org @, sfaRd serg @ aRa w o, o siaviedl s @ I & &
Al ve e & sy e et & frada &g g @ |



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Parr 1I—Sec. 3(i}|

7. ot fram #, Swey IV & e FreafaReg sudg siawnfia fear oo, swerfa-
| IUST 4 ® '
[fram s wr su-fam 2 (@ %) 3@ ]
sl @ wiiemt

N @R [WN] -

o{ie|~N|OlO|R|WIN]| =

.

3

§

!

i

!

[ § H-2/1/2013-5]

feupf-ga frem o 10 Bead, 2006 & ALHLEL (54)(3) B W A B AT, TR § |
g T Ty & ek S ardE 16 R 2010 @ WLEHLALE 982(s) BN IMRW W WA
. o ram e |

Y




[ 9 11-—@T2 3(i)] AR T USIA @ ST

MINISTRY OF COMMERCE AND INDUSTRY
{Department of Commerce)
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, thel2th August, 2013
G.S.R. 540(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by Section 55 of the Special Ficonomic

Zones Act, 2005 (28 of 2005), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further
to amend the Special Economic Zones Rules, 2006, namely :-—

1. (1) These rules may be called the Special Economic Zones (Amendment) Rules, 2013.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Special Economic Zones Rules, 2006 (herein after referred to as the principal
rules), in rule 2, in sub-rule (1), in clause (x), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-

“Provided that various categories comprising their respective products or services,
similar or compatible with each other, including related ancillary services and Research and
Development services of the sector and additional combination of products and services of a

similar or compatible nature as approved by the Board of Approval shall constitute a single
sector;”

3. In rule 5 of principal rules, in sub-rule (2),—

(i) in clause (a),-

(A) for the words “one thousand hectares”, the words “five hundred hectares™ shall be
substituted;

(B) in the first proviso, for the words “two hundred hectares”, the words “one hundred
hectares” shall be substituted;

(ii) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(b)(i) A Special Economic Zone for a specific sector or for one or more
services or in a port or airport, shall have a contiguous area of fifty hectares
or more:

Provided that for each contiguous fifty hectare land,-
(A) in a Special Economic Zone; or

(B) which is added to the Special Economic Zone,
an additional sector may be allowed:



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY {Paxr IT - Sec. 3(1)|

Provided that the additional land requirement for an additional
sector in a Special Economic Zone for a specific sector or for one or more
services as per first proviso will be twenty five hectares when the Special
Economic Zone is proposed to be set up in Assam, Meghalaya, Nagaland,
Arunachal Pradesh, Mizoram, Manipur, Tripura, Himachal Pradesh,
Uttarakhand, Sikkim, Jammu and Kashmir, Goa or in a Union territory.

(ii) There shall be no minimum area requirement for setting up a Special
Economic Zone for Information Technology or Information Technology
Enabled Services, but a minimum built up processing area requirement
shall be applicable, based on the category of cities, as follows:—

TABLE
Category of cities as per Minimum built up area
Annexure [VA requirement
Category ‘A’ 1,00,000 sq mts
Category ‘B’ 50,000 sq mts
Category *C’ 25,000 sq mts

Provided that for a Special Economic Zone proposed to be set up
exclusively for electronics hardware and software (including information
technology enabled services) the area shall be ten hectares or more as well
as a minimum built up processing arca requirement as applicable for a
Special Economic Zone for Information Technology or Information
Technology Enabled Services, based on the category of cities, referred to
in the Table:

J Provided further that in case a Special Economic Zone is proposed
to be set up exclusively for handicrafts, the area shall be ten hectares or
more:

Provided also that in case a Special Economic Zone is proposed to
be set up exclusively for bio-technology, non-conventional energy,
including solar energy equipments or cell, or gems and jewellery sectors,
agro-based food processing, the area shall be ten hectares or more with a
minimum built up area as under:

(i) forty thousand square meters in case of a Special Economic Zone

. proposed to be set up exclusively for bio-technology and non-
conventional energy sectors, including solar energy equipments or
cells and agro-based food processing sector but excluding a Special
Economic Zone set up for non-conventional energy production and
manufacturing;




[ am [[--@vs 3(i)] AR &1 oIS : STHIERT

(ii) fifty thousand square meters in case of a Special Economic Zone
proposed to be set up exclusively for the gems and jewellery sector:

Provided also that in case a Special Economic Zone for a specific
sector is proposed to be set up in Assam, Meghalaya, Nagaland,
Arunachal Pradesh, Mizoram, Manipur, Tripura, Himachal Pradesh,
Uttarakhand, Sikkim, Jammu and Kashmir, Goa or in a Union territory,
the area shall be twenty five hectares or more for the Special Economic
Zones not covered under the first, second and third provisos:

Provided also that in respect of Special Economic Zones (other than
Information Technology or Information Technology Enabled Services
Special Economic Zones) located in B1 category cities as per
classification indicated in Annexure-IV, the minimum built up area shall
be fifty per cent of the area specified above and in respect of Special
Economic Zones located in B2 category cities as indicated in Annexure
IV, the minimum built up area shall be twenty five per cent of such area
specified above:

Provided also that Board of Approval may allow additional sectors in
the category where the minimum land area requirement is ten hectares:

Provided also that not less than fifty per cent of such area shall be
earmarked for developing processing area.

(iii) in clause (c), for the words “one thousand” the words “five hundred” shall be
substituted.

4. In rule 11 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (11), after second proviso, the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided also that addition or inclusion of any land to an existing Special
Economic Zone , where such land contains a port, manufacturing unit, or structures
in which no commercial, industrial or economic activity is in progress, then such
Special Economic Zone shall not be eligible for any duty benefits in respect of the
pre-existing structures but any additions or up-gradations to such existing ports,
manufacturing units, or structures after their addition or inclusion in a Special
Economic Zone shall be eligible for the fiscal incentives as applicable for a new
infrastructure in a Special Economic Zone and also the authorised operations being
carried on in such infrastructure shall be eligible for benefits as provided for under
the Special Economic Zone Act and rules.”

5. In rule 19 of principal rules, in sub-rule (2), in the third proviso, for the words,
“provided also that”, the words “provided also that, subject to the provisions of rule 74A,”
shall be substituted.




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [Parr 1-—Scec. 3()]

6. After rule 74 of principal rules, , the following rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“74A . Transfer of Assets by Special Economic Zone Units upon their exit.— The Unit
may opt out of Special Economic Zone by transferring its assets and liabilities to another
person by way of transfer of ownership including sale of Special Economic Zone units
subject to the following conditions:—

(i) the Unit has held a valid Letter of Approval as well as lease of land for not less
than a period of five years on the date of transfer;

(ii) the unit has been operational for a minimum period of two years after the
commencement of production as on the date of transfer ;

(iii) such sale or transfer transactions shall be subject to the approval of the Approval
Committee;

(iv) the transferee fulfils all eligibility criteria applicable to a Unit; and

(v) the applicable duties and liabilities, if any, as calculated under rule 74, as well as
export obligations of the transferor Unit, if any, shall stand transferred to the
transferee Unit which shall be under obligation to discharge the same on the same
terms and conditions as the transferor Unit.”,

7. In the principal rules, after Annexure IV, the following Annexure shall be inserted,
namely:-

“ANNEXURE IVA
( [Refer sub-rule 2 (ba) of rule 5]
CLASSIFICATION OF CITIES

City classification

Category ‘A’

1 Greater Mumbai

2 Delhi NCR

3 Kolkata
4 Chennai
5 Bengaluru

6 Hyderabad

7 Pune

Category ‘B’

1 Ahmedabad

2 Bhubaneswar




[S9FT [I—@vE 3(i )]

U =T YA ¢ STHIYT

9

3 Chandigarh

4 Coimbatore

5 Indore

6 Jaipur

7 Kochi

8 Lucknow

9 Madurai

10 Mangalore

11 Nagpur

12 Thiruvananthapuram

13 Tiruchirappali

14 Vadodara

15 Visakhapatnam

Category ‘C’

( All other cities

Note:— The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary vide
number G.S.R. 54 (E), dated the 10™ February, 2006 and last amended vide G.S.R.

982 (E) dated the 16™ December, 2010.

[F. No. C.2/1/2013-SE7)]

RAJEEYV ARORA, Jt. Scey.

Printed by the Manager, Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



